
On August 9th, 2016, the Punta Gorda Police Department (PGPD) requested the Florida
Department of Law Enforcement (FDLE) conduct an investigation of a shooting that involved
PGPD Officer Lee Coel, which resulted in the death of Mary Knowlton. The incident occurred at
the Punta Gorda Police Department, located at 1410 Tamiami Trail, Punta Gorda, Florida.
 
On October 27th, 2016, Special Agent (SA) Gary Negrinelli received two separate FDLE
Laboratory Reports, one dated September 9th, 2016 and the other dated September 14th,
2016. Both reports were completed by Senior Crime Laboratory Analyst (SCLA) Lee Dewey. 
The report from September 9th was in reference to the initial response and collection of
evidence from the incident scene at PGPD (see IR 1 for further details). The report from
September 14th was in reference to the collection of evidence at the Charlotte County Sheriff's
Office Gun Range (see IR 65 for further details). 
 
These laboratory reports will be maintained electronically in related items as INV-86 and INV-
87.
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On August 9th, 2016, the Punta Gorda Police Department (PGPD) requested the Florida
Department of Law Enforcement (FDLE) conduct an investigation of a shooting that involved
PGPD Officer Lee Coel, which resulted in the death of Mary Knowlton. The incident occurred at
the Punta Gorda Police Department, located at 1410 Tamiami Trail, Punta Gorda, Florida.
 
On August 12, 2016, Special Agent (SA) Gary Negrinelli requested an eTrace through
the Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, Firearms and Explosives (ATF) for the Smith and Wesson
revolver used in the PGPD shooting. The results from eTrace revealed the current possessor of
the firearm as Lee Michael Coel.
 
On August 18, 2016, SA Negrinelli made contact with Technical Service Representative Justin
Mortensen, with Alliant/Blazer/CCI/Speer. Mortensen corresponded via email with SA Negrinelli,
and stated Blazer does not produce blank ammunition for centerfire firearms.
 
The eTrace report from ATF and email from Justin Mortensen were attached as related items,
INV-88 and INV-89, respectively.
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On August 9th, 2016, the Punta Gorda Police Department (PGPD) requested the Florida
Department of Law Enforcement (FDLE) conduct an investigation of a shooting that involved
PGPD Officer Lee Coel, which resulted in the death of Mary Knowlton. The incident occurred at
the Punta Gorda Police Department, located at 1410 Tamiami Trail, Punta Gorda, Florida.
 
On November 15th, 2016, SA Negrinelli contacted Officer Coel's attorney, Jerry Berry, in
reference to the email from Berry containing the letter summarizing Coel's statement. In the
letter,

 

 

 
SA Negrinelli contacted PGPD Lt. Terry Cochran with the above information and asked Lt.
Cochran if he could identify the call Officer Coel made to dispatch reference the test firing of the
blanks.
 
On November 23, 2016, Lt. Cochran contacted SA Negrinelli to inform him that they checked all
calls made from Officer Coel during the proposed time in June from both Coel's personal and
work cell phones. None of the calls were in reference to test firing blanks. Lt. Cochran said he
also asked Dispatcher Ashley Able about the phone call and she said that she did not
remember ever receiving such a phone call from Officer Coel.
 
On December 20, 2016, SA Negrinelli interviewed Dispatcher Ashley Able at the PGPD. Able
said she did not remember ever receiving a phone call from Officer Coel in reference to
conducting a test fire of blank ammunition at the Charlotte County Speedway. Able said that Lt.
Cochran had dispatch search all calls made by Officer Coel to dispatch and no calls were
identified as Officer Coel notifying of the test fire at the Charlotte County Speedway.
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On January 5, 2017, SA Negrinelli received an email from Lt. Cochran in reference to Officer
Coel's phone call records. Lt. Cochran included audio of all calls made from or to Officer Coel
and PGPD dispatch from May 30-July 17, 2016. Lt. Cochran also included email
communications between himself and the PGPD Communication Supervisor as well as Officer
Coel's department phone usage and charges from May 28-July 25, 2016. After reviewing all
recorded phone calls, SA Negrinelli did not find the phone call that Officer Coel

 
A copy of Lt. Cochran emails with the PGPD Communication Supervisor and Officer Coel's
department phone detail will be electronically maintained as related item, INV-93.
 
The audio of all the phone calls with Officer Coel is being maintained as related item number
INV-94.
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